WILLIAMSON COUNTY
Leslie Mitchell, CPPO, CPPB
1320 West Main Street, Suite 130
Franklin, Tennessee 37064
(615) 790-5868
lesliem@williamson-tn.org

November 21, 2016

Intent to Award

Please accept this as notice that Williamson County is issuing the Intent to
Award for wellness equipment for the Franklin Recreation Center to Fitwork, the low bid
meeting specifications. Attached is a list of bids received. Any protests regarding this
Intent to Award must be received in writing by the Williamson County Purchasing Agent
no later than 4:30 p.m. Central Time on Monday, November 28, 2016 at the Williamson
County Administrative Complex at 1320 \West Main Street, Suite 125, Franklin,
Tennessee. If no valid protests are received by this date and time, the bid will be
awarded on the following business day. The process for protesting award of bids is
outlined in detail in the Vendor's Manual, which may be accessed from Williamson

County’s website www.williamsoncounty-tn.gov.

Leslie Mitchell, CPPO, CPPB
Purchasing Agent

»Ta Printed on recycled paper



Bid Tabulation

Wellness Equipment Franklin Rec Center

November 8, 2016
Bidder Direct Fitness  |MFAC Fitness& Exercise  |ProMaxima BSN Fitworx 123 Wellness
Chin Dip Assist S 3,345.00 | § 2,970.00 | § 3,485.00 | S 2,074.00 | no bid S 3,930.00 | 5 2,475.00
Lat Pull Down S 2,845.00 | § 3,285.00 | S 3,370.00 | S 2,074.00 | no bid S 2,925.00 | S 2,125.00
Seated Mid Row S 2,845.00 | $ 2,780.00 | S 3,370.00 | $ 2,074.00 | no bid S 2,925.00 | § 2,550.00
Leg Press S 3,845.00 | S 4,175.00 | § 4,585.00 | $ 2,174.00 | no bid 5 4,280.00 | $ 3,575.00
Leg Extension S 2,845.00 | S 2,780.00 | S 3,370.00 | § 2,074.00 | no bid S 2,925.00 | S 2,275.00
Shoulder Press S 2,845.00 | S 2,655.00 | $ 3,370.00 | S 2,074.00 | no bid ) 2,925.00 | S 2,350.00
Seated Dip S 2,845.00 | S 2,655.00 | S 3,230.00 | S 2,074.00 | no bid S 2,925.00 | § 2,250.00
Chest Press S 2,845.00 | $ 2,655.00 | S 3,370.00 | § 2,074.00 | no bid S 2,925.00 | $ 2,500.00
Leg Curl S 2,845.00 | $ 2,965.00 | § 3,370.00 | S 2,074.00 | no bid S 2,925.00 | $ 2,275.00
Biceps Curl S 2,845.00 | S 2,655.00 | $ 2,955.00 | S 2,074.00 | no bid S 2,925.00 | S 2,125.00
Inner/Outer Thigh S 2,145.00 | $ 3,350.00 | S 2,310.00 | S 2,174.00 | no bid S 2,175.00 | S 2,285.00
Rotary Torso S 2,845.00 | S 3,285.00 | S 3,435.00 | § 2,074.00 | no bid S 2,925.00 | S 2,395.00
Pec Fly/Rear Delt S 2,145.00 | § 3,285.00 | $ 3,575.00 | § 2,074.00 | no bid S 2,175.00 | $ 2,550.00
Dual Pully S 2,345.00 | § 4,555.00 | § 3,410.00 | S 2,570.00 | § 2,056.64 | S 2,650.00 | $ 4,800.00
Hold Pricing for 1 year? yes yes yes yes yes yes yes
Estimated Delivery 30 days asap 45 days 30 days 2-4 weeks 4-5 weeks

Award to Fitworx, low bidder meeting specifications




