WILLIAMSON COUNTY
Leslie Mitchell, CPPO, CPPB
1320 West Main Street, Suite 130
Franklin, Tennessee 37064
(615) 790-5868
lesliem@williamson-tn.org

November 22, 2016

Intent to Award

Please accept this as notice that Williamson County is issuing the Intent to
Award for wellness equipment for the Enrichment Center to Fitwork, the low bid meeting
specifications. Attached is a list of bids received. Any protests regarding this Intent to
Award must be received in writing by the Williamson County Purchasing Agent no later
than 4:30 p.m. Central Time on Monday, November 28, 2016 at the Williamson County
Administrative Complex at 1320 West Main Street, Suite 125, Franklin, Tennessee. If
no valid protests are received by this date and time, the bid will be awarded on the
following business day. The process for protesting award of bids is outlined in detail in
the Vendor's Manual, which may be accessed from Williamson County’s website
www.williamsoncounty-tn.gov.

Leslie Mitchell, CPPO, CPPB
Purchasing Agent
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Bid Tabulation

Wellness Equipment Enrichment Center

November 8, 2016

Direct Fitness

Bidder 123 Wellness Fitworx Pro Maxima BSN Fitness & Exercise [Solutions

Leg Press/Calf Raise no bid S 2,835.00| S 1,970.00 | no bid S 2,830.00| S 2,655.00
Leg Curl/Extension no bid S 2,127.00| $ 1,770.00 | no bid S 2,195.00| S 2,245.00
Lat Pull Down/Mid Row no bid S 2,127.00| s 1,770.00 | no bid S 2,195.00( S 2,245.00
Chest Press/Shoulder Raise no bid S 2,127.001| S 1,770.00 | no bid S 2,195.00 | S 2,245.00
Functional Trainer no bid S 3,180.00| S 2,612.95 | no bid S 3,410.00| S 2,855.00
Utility Bench no bid S 310.00 | & 285.00 | S 35400 S 395.00( S 285.00
Flat/incline Bench no bid S 620.00 | S 450.00 | $ 400.23 | S 740.00 | § 285.00
Treadmill S 4,340.00 | S 4,797.00| S 5975.00(S 5,305.56 | S 4,970.00 | $ 3,955.00
Spectrum S 4,700.00 | S 4,942001|S 4,999.00 | S 3,638.89 | S 3,825.00 | S 4,655.00
Recumbent S 2,420.00| S 1,952.00| S 2,050.00 | S 3,187.50| S 2,754.00| S 2,155.00
Upright Bide S 2,145.00 | S 1,652.00| $ 1,799.00 | $ 3,013.89 | S 2,563.00 (S 1,955.00
UBE Pro1000 S 3,685.00 (S 3,690.00 | s 3,995.00 | no bid S 3,400.00 | S 3,155.00
Hold pricing 1 year yes yes yes yes yes yes

Deliver between 1/16/17 and 1/26/17| yes yes yes yes yes yes

Award to Fitworx, low bidder meeting specifications




